Kimberlx Gibbons

From: Arianna Gonzalez <agonzalezbroker@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 19, 2025 10:42 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox

Subject: Re: PIN 0692-08-0954 application

Ok they started the open floor and they want to keep going. They don’t want to pause any construction. So they
decided just not to build the porch. Can we keep the original drawing and keep moving forward?

Thanks

Arianna Gonzalez
REALTOR®
919-866-2923

Cane & Crown Realty
869 Dry Creek Rd
Lillington NC 27546

On Tue, Aug 19, 2025 at 9:14 AM Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org> wrote:

You will have to pay a $25 revision fee and go back through EH. The permit is on HOLD until this is approved again.
Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Senior Permitting Technician

Development Services

- Harnett
y( Y COUNTY

(910) 814-6435 | kgibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice



Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Arianna Gonzalez <agonzalezbroker@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, August 18, 2025 9:52 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: Re: PIN 0692-08-0954 application

Good morning,

We just realized we submitted this drawing without the back porch. Is it ok if I just send it to you here? Do 1
need to do anything else?

Thanks!

On Wed, Jun 25, 2025 at 11:37 AM Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org> wrote:

This has been processed. You can call any time to pay the septic fee

Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Central Permitting Technician

Development Services

. Harn
/j( “T‘Ct?unertg

(910) 814-6435 | kaibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546
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https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Arianna Gonzalez <agonzalezbroker@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 25, 2025 10:15 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: PIN 0692-08-0954 application

Hi

Application attached

Thanks!

Arianna Gonzalez
REALTOR®
919-866-2923

Cane & Crown Realty

869 Dry Creek Rd

Lillington NC 27546




Arianna Gonzalez
REALTOR®
919-866-2923

Cane & Crown Realty

869 Dry Creek Rd

Lillington NC 27546




