Kimberly Gibbons

s
From: Kimberly Gibbons
Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 11:03 AM
To: Kimberly Gibbons
Subject: FW: 685 Maple

Kimberly Gibbons

Central Permitting Technician

Harnett County Development Services
420 Mckinney Parkway

P.O. Box 65 (Mailing)

Lillington, N.C. 27546

(910) 893-7525 opt.1
kaibbons@harnett.org

From: Brandie Robertson <brandierealtor@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 10:58 AM

To: Kimberly Gibbons <kgibbons@harnett.org>
Subject: Re: 685 Maple

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Please remove me as the General Contractor for 685 Maple Road, Angier NC

Thanks

Brandie

On Top Building Company
919-201-1133

On Wed, Apr 19, 2023 at 9:59 AM Kimberly Gibbons <kgibbons@harnett.org> wrote:

No ma’am the only fee’s that were paid were for Environmental and they actually went out and did the
inspection so nothing can be refunded. Can you please send me an email stating that you want your company
removed as the GC



Kimberly Gibbons

Central Permitting Technician

Harnett County Development Services
420 Mckinney Parkway

P.O. Box 65 (Mailing)

Lillington, N.C. 27546

(910) 893-7525 opt.1

kgibbons@harnett.org

From: Brandie Robertson <brandierealtor(@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 9:56 AM

To: Kimberly Gibbons <kgibbons(@harnett.org>
Subject: Re: 685 Maple

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Yes. That is perfectly fine but how can I get reimbursed for the permit fees?

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 19, 2023, at 9:25 AM, Kimberly Gibbons <kgibbons(@harnett.org> wrote:

Good morning! Is On Top Building no longer the GC on this job? I had another contractor to
call about this address so I want to verify.

Kimberly Gibbons

Central Permitting Technician



