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Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number
Harnett County R33559

i

DESCRIPTION | arv | PAID
PermitTRAK ($90.00)
MRES2507-0011 Address: 510 KIRK ADAMS RD APN: 0693-50-5050.000 ($90.00)
RESIDENTIAL MECHANICAL FEES ($90.00)

7/15/2025: MRES2507-0011 ($90.00)

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R33559 (5$90.00)

Date Paid: Tuesday, July 15, 2025

Paid By: Stephenson Heating and Air, Inc.
Cashier: DJ

Pay Method: EMV 10586803848

Printed: Tuesday, July 15, 2025 12:15 PM 1of1 l;
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Refund was successful.

Charged: $90.00  Paid:$9000 D

. Full Fee Collection

Referenced

. Processor: Cardknox

10582641405
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Refund #10582641405

O Full refund

Partial refund

DESCRIPTION

Send receipt user@mail.com

Send me a copy




Transaction refunded @

View transaction

Reference Number: 10586803848




Donna Johnson

From: Service Dept <service.stephensonhvac@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 15, 2025 7:37 AM
To: Central Permitting Mailbox
Subject: Re: 510 KIRK ADAMS DR PERMIT APPLICATION

Ok, thank you for your help.
On Mon, Jul 14, 2025 at 3:53 PM Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org> wrote:

| will get this processed and refunded today or tomorrow back to the card used. It may
take a few days for it to go thru. | am not sure.

Sincerely,

Donna Johnson
Project Coordinator / Customer Service Rep.

Development Services

_Harnett
COUNTY

(910) 814-6431 | diohnson@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://lwww.harnett. org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)



From: Service Dept <service.stephensonhvac@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 11, 2025 1:42 PM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: Re: 510 KIRK ADAMS DR PERMIT APPLICATION

Good afternoon. So | completely messed this up and we did not do a mini-split change out here today.
I'm sorry, can we void out this permit? | think | paid it this morning. My apologies.

OnThu, Jul 10, 2025 at 1:59 PM Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org> wrote:

This has been approved and ready for payment. Thank you!

From: Service Dept <service.stephensonhvac@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 10, 2025 9:03 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: 510 KIRK ADAMS DR PERMIT APPLICATION

Good morning. Please see the attached permit application.

Have a great day!

Thank you,

Lisa L. Lehman

Dispatcher

Stephenson Heating & Air Conditioning, Inc

979-329-0686



