Donna Johnson

From: Dawsons Permits <permits@calldawsons.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2025 1:10 PM

To: Donna Johnson

Subject: Re: Permit # ERES2509-0023 103 East E Street Erwin, NC 28339
Categories: Waiting on Response

Is a refund given with a voided permit?
We will talk to the customer and explain.

On Thu, Sep 11, 2025 at 1:06 PM Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org> wrote:

Thank you. Did you all speak to the customer and let him know or do | need to call him?

Sincerely,

Donna Johnson
Project Coordinator / Customer Service Rep.

Development Services

Harnett

COUNTY

(910) 814-6431 | djohnson@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://www.harnett.ora/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Dawsons Permits <permits@calldawsons.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2025 12:59 PM




s

To: Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org>
Subject: Permit # ERES2509-0023 103 East E Street Erwin, NC 28339

Good afternoon!

Can you please void this permit. The customer no longer wants to move forward.

Thank you!
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Harnett

COUNTY

Cash

Register Receipt Receipt Number
Harnett County WEB7681

DESCRIPTION | oy | PAID
PermitTRAK $80.00
ERES2509-0023 Address: 103 EE ST APN: 0597-63-8206.000 $80.00
RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES $80.00

200 AMP FEE 0 $80.00

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: WEB7681 $80.00
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Date Paid: Monday, September 08, 2025
Paid By: AEC-113

Cashier: ECON

Pay Method: CREDIT 10436986823

Printed: Wednesday, September 10, 2025 4:31 PM
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Refund #10436986823

Q Full refund

Partial refund

DESCRIPTION

ERES2509-0023

Send receipt permits@calldawsons.com

Send me a copy




Transaction refunded @

View transaction

Reference Number: 10440852624
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GIS Viewer

9 Maps
COMMUN Refund

H Gmail

£ My UNCChart - Login Page

DEVELOF

@  Cardknox Portal Live View | McKinney UNVR

E:j Personal items I

Softling Web Fax - Faxes

a HRW Data (1)adsx

m Development Sennices: Wel..

Workspace

Description Code Pay Method Paid Amount refund Amount
RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES
1104915-350410 RESELEC CREDIT 80 $80.00
3 Description Code Paid Amount Refund Amount
|
1 200 AMP FEE
- 1104915-350410 200AMP 8o = .
Financial Information {.  Charged: $80.00  Paid: $80.00
Description 3 Referencef
2 = e Total: $80.00 i o e
» R E é Refund Method EMV - [ S ArokHoy
ESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC ; Refund Method 10426986823
M Refund To Dawsons Electnc & Ar all
4 eference Number 10440852624 *
q e4as
i 3 :Landowner does not want work done
| N ‘.
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; : s - TR UTSIZOTS” Sant By MM
.. AUTO Remiarks = {no remmarks) : 9/8/2025 Received By
B Status APPROVED sturnad  9/5/2025




COMMUN Refund
DEVELO}

Refund was successful.

asrmation Charged: $80.00  Paid: $80.00

oS

Referenced

Processor: Cardknox
10436086823

Sent By
Received By
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AUTO : Remarks {ne remarks) Cue 9/8/2025
APPROVED Returned  9/5/2025



P e :
Pl Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

lc" ?LﬂNeJZE Harnett County R34321

DESCRIPTION | arv | PAID
PermitTRAK ($80.00)
ERES2509-0023  Address: 103 EEST  APN: 0597-63-8206.000 ($80.00)
RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES ($80.00)

9/12/2025: Landowner does not want work done. 0 ($80.00)

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R34321 (580.00)

Date Paid: Friday, September 12, 2025
Paid By: Dawsons Electric & Air
Cashier: DJ

Pay Method: EMV 10440852624

Printed: Friday, September 12, 2025 10:32 AM lof1l i.i



