Donna Johnson

e

From: Michelle F. Myatt

Sent: Monday, October 21, 2024 1:32 PM
To: Donna Johnson

Cc: cre27520@yahoo.com

Subject: RE: ERES2410-0020

Customer has not had any inspections & would like to cancel their permit.
Sincerely,

Michelle Myatt
Central Permitting Technician
Development Services

. Harnett

T COUNTY

(910) 814-6421 | mmyatt@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: cre27520@yahoo.com <cre27520@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, October 21, 2024 10:58 AM

To: Michelle F. Myatt <mmyatt@harnett.org>

Subject: ERES2410-0020

Good morning, Michelle,

I would like to know how do | go about cancelling the permit of 338 Country Spring Ln permit # ERES2410-00207?
The homeowner is no longer wanting the work to be completed and has cancelled on their end. I've already been
issued the permit | just need it to be cancelled.

Thankyou,

Qo s
Fouunddum



v Transaction refunded

View transaction

Reference Number: 10362334
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Financial Information Charged: $60.00 Paid: $60

Fees Transactions
Full Fee Colk

Payment Authorized

RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES

Charged: $60.00 Paid:
CDeposit Bal: $0.00 Cue: $0.00
Reviews
CENTRAL PERMITTING... CP Bucket M
t 10/8/2024

AUTO

APPROVED

Inspections

45 mins

Deen Tavior

—_ “FINAL**




P . ; :
¢ Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number
Harnett Harnett County R30213

COUNTY

DESCRIPTION | QTy | PAID
PermitTRAK ($60.00)
ERES2410-0020 Address: 338 COUNTRY SPRINGLN  APN: 0598-72-8717.000 ($60.00)
RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES ($60.00)

11/14/2024: Not doing work

Reference No. 10332611906 0 (>60.00)

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R30213 (560.00)

[Pt 11d 24

Date Paid: Thursday, November 14, 2024
Paid By: South East Foundation

Cashier: DJ

Pay Method: EMV 10332611906

iy
Printed: Thursday, November 14, 2024 3:27 PM 1of1 15



