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DIgh Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number
Harnett Harnett County R29748

COUNTY

DESCRIPTION I QTy |
PermitTRAK $60.00
ERES2410-0020 Address: 338 COUNTRY SPRING LN APN: 0598-72-8717.000 $60.00
RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES $60.00
MINIMUM ELECTRICAL FEE

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R29748

Date Paid: Wednesday, October 09, 2024
Paid By: South East Foundation

Cashier: KBG

Pay Method: EMV 10332611906

Printed: Tuesday, October 29, 2024 8:21 AM 1of1
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_Donna Johnson

From: cre27520@yahoo.com

Sent: Monday, October 28, 2024 4:34 PM
To: Donna Johnson

Subject: RE: ERES2410-0022

Awesome thank you.

There was also another one | emailed about last week Michelle Myatt forwarded my email to you on the day you
were out. It was also a cancelation of a permit that has already been issued for the address of 338 Country Spring
Ln permit# ERES2410-0020.

From: Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org>
Sent: Monday, October 28, 2024 4:30 PM

To: cre27520@yahoo.com

Subject: RE: ERES2410-0022

| will get your refund done this week for you. It will go back on the cc that was used.

Sincerely,

Donna Johnson
Project Coordinator / Customer Service Rep.
Development Services

. Harnett

"COUNTY

(910) 814-6431 | djohnson@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://www.harnett. org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: cre27520@yahoo.com <cre27520@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, October 28, 2024 1:56 PM

To: Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org>

Subject: ERES2410-0022

Good afternoon, Donna,

| would like to know how do | go about cancelling the permit for 105 Longview Pl permit # ERES2410-00227 I've
already been issued the permit, but the homeowner no longer wants the work to be completed and have cancelled
on their end. If you could help me with this, | would greatly appreciate it.

Thank you,



