Kimberly Gibbons
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From: Brandon Lee <brandonlee.electric@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, July 11, 2025 11:38 AM
To: Central Permitting Mailbox
Subject: Re: Electrical permit application

Yes

Thank You
And God Bless

Brandon Lee

On Fri, Jul 11, 2025, 11:37 AM Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org> wrote:

Is this an upgrade on the main panel for the house?
Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Senior Permitting Technician

Development Services

S Hamett

. NORTH CAROLINA

(910) 814-6435 | kgibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)




From: Brandon Lee <brandonlee.electric@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 11, 2025 11:33 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: Re: Electrical permit application

Okay. I know she had somebody else quote it. I didn't realize it got far enough for them to do a permit. Either
way. It will be us doing the work now.

Thank You
And God Bless

Brandon Lee

On Fri, Jul 11, 2025, 11:28 AM Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org> wrote:

It was a different electrical company.
Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Senior Permitting Technician

Development Services

-~ _Harn
/—)('QCEU Ne'l"nY:

(910) 814-6435 I kgibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)



From: Brandon Lee <brandonlee.electric@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 11, 2025 11:26 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: Re: Electrical permit application

I've been discussing this with the lady for several months. It wasn't me was it?

Thank You
And God Bless

Brandon Lee

On Fri, Jul 11, 2025, 11:13 AM Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org> wrote:

Good morning! What exactly are you needing this permit for? There was a 200 amp service upgrade applied for back
in 2024. It was paid for but no inspections were ever scheduled.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Senior Permitting Technician

Development Services

A Hanett

NORTH CAROLINA

(910) 814-6435 I kaibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/




Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Brandon Lee <brandonlee.electric@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 11, 2025 10:30 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: Fwd: Electrical permit application

Thank You
And God Bless

Brandon Lee

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Brandon Lee <brandonlee.electric@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, Jul 11, 2025, 10:28 AM

Subject: Electrical permit application

To: Brandon Lee <brandonlee.electric@gmail.com>

Thank You
And God Bless

Brandon Lee



