Donna Johnson
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From: Matthew Roy <firnatine265@aol.com>
Sent: Friday, November 12, 2021 3:16 PM
To: Donna Johnson
Subject: Re: Permit

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Matthew Roy will be doing the electrical work at 311 Thorntons creek drive for the metal concrete building we are
installing.

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 27, 2021, at 3:10 PM, Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org> wrote:

If you still have a copy of the original building app that you signed you can sign your name on the
electrical section and | can sell you a permit for the electrical. it will cost $80.00. | can take a cc/debit
card over the phone.

Thanf you,

Donna Johngon

Harnett County Project Coordinator/CSR
PO Box 66

420 McKinney Phwy.

LiCington, NC 275646

Main # (970) 893-7526

Direct # (970) 814-6431

“Wole onr pAygical ocalion Aag changed ™™

From: Matthew Roy <firnatine265@aol.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 27, 2021 12:47 PM
To: Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org>

Subject: Re: Permit

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

| am also going to need to add electric to this building and wasn’t even thinking about it. | am going to
add a separate power meter for it. Am | needing to get a permit for that as well or can it be added in to
the original one

Sent from my iPhone



On Oct 11, 2021, at 12:25 PM, Matthew Roy <firnatine265@aol.com> wrote:

Just checking to see if he had a chance to look at plans early ?

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 6, 2021, at 3:59 PM, Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org>
wrote:

Thank you,

Donna Johingon

Harnett County Project Coordinator/CSR
PO Box 66

420 McKinnoy Phwy.

LiCCington, NC 27546

Main # (910) 893-7626

Direct # (9710) 81%-6431

“Nole onr pAygical docation Aag cAanged ™"

<Permit Form (1).pdf>




