Kimberlz Gib#%ons

From: Kimberly Gibbons

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 9:07 AM

To: Jennifer S. Bethune

Subject: FW: 56 Blair Drive Angier Trade Permit

Kimberly Gibbgns

Central Permitting Technician

Harnett County] Development Services
420 Mckinney Parkway

P.O. Box 65 (Mailing)

Lillington, N.C.[27546

(910) 893-752% opt.1
kgibbons@harhett.org

From: James Jennings <jrjennings080@yahoo.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2024 7:51 PM

To: Jeansari Reyes <jreyes@harnett.org>

Cc: Central Permitting <CentralPermiting@harnett.org>
Subject: Re: 56 Blair Drive Angier Trade Permit

Ok, thank you/ I paid for the permit, can I have that refunded?

Thank you

On Jun 26, 2024, at 4:04 PM, Jeansari Reyes <jreves(@harnett.org> wrote:

Good Afternoon,

This address is in the Town of Angier jurisdiction. Please reach out to them for processing.

Sincenply,

Jearsari M. Reyes

Residential Plans Reviewer Technician
420 McKinney Pkwy

PO Bax 65

Lillington NC 27546

Main] 910-893-7525
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From: James Jennings <jrjennings080@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 2:19 PM

To: Jeansari Reyes <jreyes@harnett.org>

Subject: 56 Blair Drive Angier Trade Permit

Attached, is the mechanical trade permit for 56 Blair Drive, Angier.

Thank you
James Jennings
410-570-4234



