Application #

Harnett County Central Permitting ‘
PO Box 85 Lillington, NC 27546 - Ph: 910-893-7525 - Fx 910-893-2783 - www.hamett org/permits
Certification of Work Performed By Owner/Contractor
(Individual Trade Application)

Lamar Advertising
5200 attantic ave Ralsigh nc

7
Owner (s) of Structure: - £19-755-19090

Owner (s) Mailing Address:

Phon

Land Owner Name (s): Phone:
Construction or Site Address: 30 Luart Drive Lillingten NC. Hwy 421 3/10 mil s/o sr1208 Joe Collins Rd.

PIN # Parcel #

00U Se€ aHacked emaid . _ _ |
Job Cost: 1500 Description of Work o be do M‘ﬁepaace Damaged Electrical Service on Bill Brod Sign

Mechanical: New Unit With Ductwerk ___ New Unil Without Ductwork ___ Gas Piping ___ Other ____

Electrical™ 200 Amp ___ <200 Amp ____ Service Change ¥ Service Reconnect ___ Other ___
* For Progress Energy customers we need the premise number

Plumbing: Water/Sewer Tap Number of Baths Waler Heater

ack yard of 30 Luart Drive. the nautral lug in heater base Is burned up.

Subdivision: Lot #

| Lynwoad Figge will provide the oo labor on this structure.
(Contractors Name) (Trade)

| am the building owner or my NC state license number is e , which entitles me lo

perform such work on the above structure legally. All work shall comply with the Stale Building Code and all
other applicable State and local laws, ordinances and regulations.

Riggs and Asscciates Elsctrical Contraclors 252-560-2878
Conlractor's Company Name Telephone
PO Bax 1537 Kinston NC 28503 randasc@hotmall.com
Address Email Address
16213V
License #

. ' 9-8-21
Structure Owner / Contraclor Signature: Date:

By signing this application you affirm that yOu have obtained ‘permission from the above listed license hoider to
purchase permits on their behall. If doing the work as owner you understand that you cannol rent, lease or sell
the listed property for 12 months after complétion of the listed work.

*Company name, address, & phone must match information on license



Jeanann Dawson

From: Trista Johnson <tristajohnson@riggsandassociatesec.com>
Sent: Monday, September 13, 2021 11:14 AM

To: Jeanann Dawson

Subject: Re: Electrical permit

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Job cost $1500.00

On Fri, Sep 10, 2021 at 2:53 PM Jeanann Dawson <jdawson@harnett.org> wrote:

Please advise of job cost.

Jeanann Dawson

Central Permitting Technician
Department of Development Services
Central Permitting Division

420 McKinney Pkwy

Lillington, NC 27546

Phone: 910-893-7525

Direct: 910-814-6421

Fax: 910-893-2793

jdawson@harnett.org




From: Trista Johnson <tristajohnson@riggsandassociatesec.com>
Sent: Friday, September 10, 2021 9:47 AM

To: Central Permitting <CentralPermiting@harnett.org>

Subject: Electrical permit

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Electrical permit application

Trista Johnson
Riggs and Associates Electrical Contractors
Administrative Assistant & Bookkeeper

252-220-0402

Trista Johnson



