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Kimberlz Gibbons

From: Charlene Maahs <Charlene.Maahs@tarheelbasementsystems.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2025 1:40 PM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox

Subject: RE: [External] RE: BRES-2509-0005

Yes there is. The electrician should be reaching out to pull their own permit for their work.

Thank you,
Charlene Maahs

From: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2025 1:39 PM

To: Charlene Maahs <Charlene.Maahs@tarheelbasementsystems.com>
Subject: [External] RE: BRES-2509-0005

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good afternoon! Is there any electrical work being done still?
Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Senior Permitting Technician
Development Services

S

= NORTH CAROLINA

(910) 814-6435 | kgibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Charlene Maahs <Charlene.Maahs@tarheelbasementsystems.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2025 1:22 PM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>

Cc: Raleigh Accounting <raleighaccounting@tarheelbasementsystems.com>
Subject: BRES-2509-0005

Good afternoon,

We kindly request the cancellation of permit #BRES-2509-0005 as we are no longer encapsulating the
crawlspace.



Kind Regards,
Charlene Maahs
(336) 245-1176

TARHEEL

BASEMENT SYSTEMS

A Groundworks Company
This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or
entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the system manager.




Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

Harnett County R34266
DESCRIPTION ] Qry ' PAID
PermitTRAK $185.00
BRES2509-0005  Address: 105 MARSHA CT  APN: 0597-91-4657.000 $125.00
PLAN REVIEW FEES $25.00
PLAN REVIEW FEE RESIDENTIAL ] 0 | $25.00
RESIDENTIAL BUILDING FEES $100.00
RES GARAGE AND RES BUILDING PERMIT ONLY [ 0 I $100.00
ERES2509-0012 Address: 105 MARSHA CT APN: 0597-91-4657.000 $60.00
RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES $60.00
MINIMUM ELECTRICAL FEE $60.00

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R34266

Date Paid: Tuesday, September 09, 2025
Paid By: Groundworks North Carolina LLC
Cashier: KBG

Pay Method: EMV 10437944797

Printed: Wednesday, September 17, 2025 1:41 PM 1of1l 1



Transaction refunded &

View transaction

Reference Number: 10449814465




Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

Harnett County R34452
DESCRIPTION [ QTy ’ PAID
PermitTRAK ($125.00)
BRES2509-0005 Address: 105 MARSHA CT APN: 0597-91-4657.000 ($125.00)
PLAN REVIEW FEES (525.00)
9/22/2025: Not doing work l 0 ($25.00)
RESIDENTIAL BUILDING FEES (5100.00)

9/22/2025: Not doing work ($100.00)

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R34452 ($125.00)

Date Paid: Monday, September 22, 2025
Paid By: Groundworks North Carolina LLC
Cashier: KBG

Pay Method: EMV 10449814465

Printed: Monday, September 22, 2025 2:21 PM lof1 I




Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

Harnett County R34453
DESCRIPTION | ary | PAID
PermitTRAK ($60.00)
ERES2509-0012 Address: 105 MARSHACT  APN: 0597-91-4657.000 (560.00)
RESIDENTIAL ELECTRIC FEES ($60.00)
9/22/2025: Not doing work ($60.00)

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R34453 ($60.00)

Date Paid: Monday, September 22, 2025
Paid By: Groundworks North Carolina LLC
Cashier: KBG

Pay Method: EMV

Printed: Monday, September 22, 2025 2:24 PM 1of1 l



