KimberI! Gibbons

From: Central Permitting Mailbox

Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 11:24 AM
To: Norton, Ruth

Subject: FW: Website Inquiry

Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Central Permitting Technician
Development Services

~ ~ Harnett

™S COUNTY

j" NORTH CARCLINA

(910) 814-6435 | kgibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Jaime Dishler <jaimedishler81@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 9:10 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: Website Inquiry

Inquiry For: | Central Permitting .
Full Name: | Jaime Dishler N
Address: | 418 Auburndale Ct

Address 2: |

City: Sanford

State: NC

Zip Code: 27330

Telephone: 9193964543



Email Address: | jaimedishler8 1@ gmail.com

My husband and | submitted applications for a piece of land we were going to purchase at

30 N Forsythe rd. We are no longer moving forward w that land purchase. The county has
Comments: . : g : :

not been out yet to do inspection for water and septic. Is there any options of getting our

- money back? Thank you Jaime Dishler

Submitter: | 104.28.32.22



Kimberly Gibbons W-3-LS

From: Kelley Hinson vyeyro \r~Q,\
Sent: Thursday. ﬁ.spnl 3, 2025 8:40 AM C,\Q‘ Q
To: Kimberly Gibbons

Subject: RE: Website Inquiry

Good Morning
Yes they can get a refund for the septic.

Kelley Hinson

Office Assistant [V

Environmental Health

Phone: (910) 893-7547 Fax: (910) 718-0415 | Email : khinson@harnett.org | Online: www.harnett.org/
Address: 307 W Cornelius Harnett Blvd Lillington NC 27546 (Physical)

~ _Harnett
/j('“\couurv

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice
Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 11:23 AM

To: Kelley Hinson <khinson@harnett.org>

Cc: Oliver Tolksdorf <otolksdorf@harnett.org>

Subject: FW: Website Inquiry

Please see below. Customer is wanting a refund. It doesn’t look like anyone has been out yet.
Sincerely,

Kimberly Gibbons
Central Permitting Technician
Development Services

- Harnett
“)("'\ COUNTY

HORTH CAROLINA

(910) 814-6435 | kgibbons@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.ora/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)




From: Jaime Dishler <jaimedishler81@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 9:10 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>
Subject: Website Inquiry

Inquiry For:
Full Name:
Address:
Address 2:
City:

| State:
Zip Code:

Telephone:

Email Address:

Comments:

Submitter:

Central Permitting
Jaime Dishler

418 Auburndale Ct

Sanford

NC

27330

9193964543

jaimedishler8 1 @gmail.com

My husband and I submitted applications for a piece of land we were going to purchase at
30 N Forsythe rd. We are no longer moving forward w that land purchase. The county has |
not been out yet to do inspection for water and septic. Is there any options of getting our
money back? Thank you Jaime Dishler

104.28.32.222




Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

Harnett.

COUNTY

Harnett County R31983

DESCRIPTION | ary | PAID
PermitTRAK $750.00
BRES2503-0071  Address: 30 N FORSYTHE LN  APN: 9563-95-6779.000 $750.00
ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH FEES $750.00

NEW SOIL ANALYSIS FEE $750.00

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R31983

\L&CCXM L

VO LR 1S\ e 2N
Date Paid: Tuesday, March 25, 2025
Paid By: Ben & Jamie Dishler
Cashier: KBG
Pay Method: EMV 10278907748
[
Printed: Thursday, April 03, 2025 9:12 AM 1of1 !




Transaction refunded @

View transaction

Reference Number: 10287418637




| Dl [N
Transaction Type: Payment
Id: b6706073-6878-488¢-3151-a18b41154e02 Created: 3/25/2025 1:06:16 PM

Processor: Cardknox

Reference Number: 10278907748 Status Override

Receipt Number: R31983

| CheckStatus || void

Type  Id

Override was successful. pount . ‘Pay Me

b Permit BRES2503-0071

|

Close







Refund was successful.







Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

Harnett County R32138
DESCRIPTION | arr | PAID
PermitTRAK ($750.00)
BRES2503-0071 Address: 30 N FORSYTHE LN APN: 9563-95-6779.000 ($750.00)
ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH FEES (5750.00)
4/3/2025: Customer cancelled permit ($750.00)

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R32138 ($750.00)

Date Paid: Thursday, April 03, 2025

Paid By: Ben & Jamie Dishler

Cashier: KBG

Pay Method: CREDIT CARD 10287418637

Printed: Thursday, April 03, 2025 9:19 AM lof1l ‘



Financial Information

Fees Transactions
\ [ Add ]f _v?wg”_ r'a_r-?.'.}}f]{'ri:-u-a}%»- H n:.\r.\,,i]
Description Quy Amount Comments
) ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH FEES Paid: $0.00
» | LAND USE FEES $25.00
) MANUFACTURED HOME FEES $200.00
) RESIDENTIAL BUILDING FEES $100.00 10X10 DECK
Charged: $325.00 Paid:

Deposit Bal: $0.00 Due: !



Last Transaction Status

Refund Authorized
4/3/2025 9:19:09 AM
CREDIT CARD

$0.00
$325.00

Charged: $325.00

Reference#

Processor: Internal
R32138

Paid: $0.

Full Fee C



