Transaction refunded @

View transaction

Reference Number: 10422853062




Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

Harnett County R34088
DESCRIPTION | QTy ‘ PAID
PermitTRAK ($125.00)
BRES2410-0028 Address: 6156 OLD US 421  APN: 0620-35-4139.000 ($125.00)
LAND USE FEES ($25.00)
8/22/2025: Not doing job ] 0 ($25.00)
RESIDENTIAL BUILDING FEES ($100.00)

8/22/2025: Not doing job 0 (5100.00)

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R34088 ($125.00)

Date Paid: Friday, August 22, 2025

Paid By: Groundworks North Carolina LLC T/A
Cashier: KBG

Pay Method: EMV

Printed: Friday, August 22, 2025 1:23 PM lof1l




Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number

Harnett County R29984
DESCRIPTION
PermitTRAK $275.00
BRES2410-0013 Address: 2773 US401S  APN: 0558-87-9034.000 $150.00
LAND USE FEES $25.00
LAND USE PERMIT FEE | 0 | $25.00
PLAN REVIEW FEES $25.00
PLAN REVIEW FEE RESIDENTIAL ] 0 | $25.00
RESIDENTIAL BUILDING FEES $100.00
RES GARAGE AND RES BUILDING PERMIT ONLY ] 0 | $100.00
BRES2410-0028 Address: 6156 OLD US 421  APN: 0620-35-4139.000 $125.00
LAND USE FEES $25.00
LAND USE PERMIT FEE | 0 | 525.00
RESIDENTIAL BUILDING FEES $100.00
RES GARAGE AND RES BUILDING PERMIT ONLY $100.00

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R29984 $275.00

Date Paid: Friday, October 25, 2024

Paid By: Groundworks North Carolina LLC T/A
Cashier: MM

Pay Method: EMV 10343698094

Printed: Friday, August 22, 2025 1:11 PM 1of1 1‘




Kimberlx Gibbons

From: Central Permitting Mailbox

Sent: Wednesday, August 20, 2025 8:11 AM
To: Kimberly Gibbons

Subject: FW: Website Inquiry

Amanda Wiles

Administrative Support Specialist I
Development Services

et

NORTH CAROLINA

(910).814.6430 | awiles@harnett.org
420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Central Permitting: Welcome
/

harnett.orc

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice
Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and
shall be disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Ashley Handford <raleighaccounting@tarheelbasementsystems.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 19, 2025 9:58 AM

To: Central Permitting Mailbox <centralpermitting@harnett.org>

Subject: Website Inquiry

- |
Inquiry For: Central Permitting
Full Name: Ashley Handford
Address: 8005 Knightdale Blvd.

Address 2: }



City:

— ’
| Zip“C;de:

Telephone:
Email Address:

Comments:

' Knightdale | |
r
| . _. |
27545

| |

J raleighuccouming(k(tarhcelbascmenlsvstems.com J

l Good morning,

|

The customer cancelled the project for Permit# RES2410-0028 (6156 Old US 421,
Lillington), can you please cancel / withdraw the permit?

Please let me know if you have any questions or if anything is needed on our end to move
forward with cancelling this permit.

Thank you in advance!

-Ashley Handford
165.225.38.134



