Donna Johnson

From: Jimmy <jimcrakcorn1966@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, September 22, 2023 12:.01 AM
To: Donna Johnson

Subject: Fwd: LiensNC Payment Receipt

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: noreply@liensnc.com
Date: September 21, 2023 at 11:58:26 PM EDT
Subject: LiensNC Payment Receipt

Payment Receipt Confirmation

Your payment was successfully processed.

Thank you for your purchase! The transaction details should only be used for financial records and DOES NOT SERVE AS PROOF OF THE L

Transaction Summary

Description Amount
Liens NC $30.00
Total Amount Paid $30.00

Customer Information

Customer Name James Hall
Company Name

Local Reference ID 663535

Receipt Date 9/21/2023
Receipt Time 11:58:25 PM EDT

Payment Information

Payment Type Credit Card
Credit Card Type VISA
Credit Card Number xeeErx8403
Order ID 75848068

Billing Name JAMES HALL



Billing Information

Billing Address

Billing City, State

ZIP/Postal Code

Country

Phone Number

This receipt has been emailed to the address below.
Email Address

6571 Rosser Pittman Rf
Sanford , NC

27332

us

9197703056

jimcrakcorn1966@gmail.com
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1 filings found - Viewing 1-1

Filing Type

Project Property

Appointment of Lien
Agent
09/21/2023

Entry #:
2004620

=]

jimcrakcorn1966@g
mail.com

6587 Rosser
Pittman Rd

Sanford , NC 27332
Harnett County

Claimant / Owner |ames Hall

6571 Rosser
Pittman Rd, Sanford
, NC 27332 United
States

Phone:
919-770-3056
jimcrakcorn1966@g
mail.com

Active Related Filings?

Action



