Donna Johnson

From: Bradley Reeves <sales@parrotbaypoolsnc.com>
Sent: Monday, November 4, 2019 4:25 PM

To: Donna Johnson

Subject: Re: Permit #BRES1909-0053
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Does this work?
On Fri, Nov 1, 2019 at 3:14 PM Donna Johnson <djohnson(@harnett.org> wrote:

Done. Everything is ready. The total fee due is $125.00.

Thank you,

Donna M. Johnson

Harnett County Development Services
Central Permitting Division

Project Coordinator/Customer Service Rep
108 E. Front St

PO Box 65



Lillington, NC 27546
910-814-6431 (o)

910-893-7527 (m)

From: Bradley Reeves [mailto:sales@parrotbaypoolsnc.com]
Sent: Friday, November 1, 2019 7:23 AM

To: Central Permitting <CentralPermiting@harnett.org>
Subject: Permit #BRES1909-0053

Application attached.

Appointment of Lien Agent
09/25/2019

e Entry #: 1115877

Please let me know if there is anything else required at this time.

Thanks,
Bradley

(919) 527-4847



