N : : :
X Cash Register Receipt Receipt Number
Harnett Harnett County R34546

COUNTY

DESCRIPTION o |
PermitTRAK $58.00
BCOM2508-0005 Address: 410 DENIMDR  APN: 0597-84-4269.000 $58.00
FIRE MARSHAL FEES $58.00
FIRE ALARM TESTING FEE $58.00

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R34546

Date Paid: Monday, September 29, 2025
Paid By: William Ford

Cashier: MM

Pay Method: EMV 10454804615

Printed: Tuesday, September 30, 2025 8:11 AM lofl l



Kimberlx Gibbons

From: Michelle F. Myatt

Sent: Tuesday, September 30, 2025 8:22 AM

To: Mark Ford

Ce: . Austin Lee; Andrew Dorman; Donna Johnson
Subject: RE: BCOMZ2508-0005 410 DENIM DR
Attachments: Fire Alarm Receipt.pdf

Hi Mark,

We will refund the S58 for the Fire Alarm Permit.

In regard to the fixed fire suppression sprinkler system (FMFW2509-0035), the Fire Marshal review was Disapproved
because “No fire sprinkler plans submitted for review, only hydraulic calculations were submitted.”

Sincerely,

Michelle Myatt
Central Permitting Technician
Development Services

f’) ("‘B tioa {lnue'rtt

NORTH CARCLINA

(910) 814-6421 | mmyatt@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546

https://harnett.org/permits/

Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)

From: Mark Ford <mford@carolinafireprotection.com>

Sent: Monday, September 29, 2025 7:34 PM

To: Michelle F. Myatt <mmyatt@harnett.org>

Cc: Austin Lee <alee@carolinafireprotection.com>; Andrew Dorman <adorman@carolinafireprotection.com>; Donna
Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org>

Subject: RE: BCOM2508-0005 410 DENIM DR

Michelle,

This is for the fire alarm system. We need permit for the fire sprinkler system submitted from Carolina Fire
Protection. This permit is for the Fire alarm permit with Albermarle alarms. We will call in the morning.
Thanks

C Carolina Fire Protection, Inc.

Mark Ford



Design Manager

4055 Hodges Chapel Road

Dunn, NC 28334

Phone: (910) 892-1700

Fax: (910) 892-7322

Email: mford@carolinafireprotection.com

From: Michelle F. Myatt <mmyatt@harnett.org>
Sent: Monday, September 29, 2025 11:25 AM

To: Mark Ford <mford @carolinafireprotection.com>
Subject: BCOM2508-0005 410 DENIM DR

E S
. You don't often get email from mmyatt@harnett.org. Learn why this is important

Please see the attached receipt & Approved Plans from the Fire Marshal.

Sincerely,

Michelle Myatt
Central Permitting Technician
Development Services

St

(910) 814-6421 | mmyatt@harnett.org

420 McKinney Parkway (physical) | PO Box 65 (mailing) | Lillington, NC 27546
https://harnett.org/permits/
Privacy & Confidentiality Notice

Email correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and shall be
disclosed to third parties when required by statutes. (NCGS Ch. 132)




Transaction refunded @

View transaction

Reference Number: 10463091476
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Harnett
COUNTY Harnett County

Cash Register Receipt

Receipt Number
R34679

DESCRIPTION 1 Qry ‘ PAID
PermitTRAK ($58.00)
BCOM2508-0005 Address: 410 DENIMDR  APN: 0597-84-4269.000 ($58.00)

FIRE MARSHAL FEES ($58.00)

10/9/2025:

TOTAL FEES PAID BY RECEIPT: R34679

($58.00)

($58.00)

Date Paid: Thursday, October 09, 2025
Paid By: Williiam Ford

Cashier: KBG

Pay Method: EMV 10463091476

Printed: Thursday, October 09, 2025 8:52 AM lof1




