Donna Johnson

From: Austin Swinson <evangelistaustinswinson@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, December 3, 2018 1:59 PM

To: Donna Johnson 6%
Subject: Re: MODULAR

. C '
$700 electrical. 6\5J 2 .
$2200 set up. . QQ
Pastor Austin Swinson @
New Life Worship Center (\/
7022 Elliott Bridge Road Vv

Spring Lake, NC 28390
www.nlwenc.com

On Dec 3, 2018, at 10:25 AM, Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org> wrote:

Ok thanks, | wasn’t sure till | saw your email this morning. He gave it to someone else. | noticed on the
building application there are not separate trade job costs. | will need those so | can let you know the
permit fees. You can email then to me if you like.

Thank you,

Donna M. Johnson

Harnett County Development Services
Central Permitting Division

Project Coordinator/Customer Service Rep
108 E. Front St

PO Box 65

Lillington, NC 27546

910-814-6431 (o)

910-893-7527 (m)

From: Austin Swinson [mailto:evangelistaustinswinson@yahoo.com]
Sent: Monday, December 3, 2018 9:07 AM

To: Donna Johnson <djohnson@harnett.org>

Subject: Re: MODULAR

Good morning! | had Randy dropped items off Friday in person.

Pastor Austin Swinson
New Life Worship Center
7022 Elliott Bridge Road
Spring Lake, NC 28390
www.nlwene.com

On Nov 27, 2018, at 2:37 PM, Donna Johnson <djohnson(@harnett.org> wrote:

Thanks

Thank you,




